
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Monday, June 18, 2012 3:02 PM 
To: Jeffre E stein 
Cc: 
Subject: Fwd: Dining room 
Attachments: image001.jpg; Untitled attachment 00119.htm; image002.gif, Untitled attachment 

00122.htm; image003.gif, Untitled attachment 00125.htm; image004.jpg; Untitled 
attachment 00128.htm; image005.gif; Untitled attachment 00131.htm; image006.git 
Untitled attachment 00134.htm; JE Dining Room S5451KS.pdf; Untitled attachment 
00137.htm 

looks like we finally have our 39k pricing from =acco.. 
i will review witMfor accuracy and if ok we will send =5% deposit 

PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH MY CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS =OLLOWS: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates =nc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, =th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Kim Steube" 
=/div> 
Date: June 18, 2012 =0:59:27 AM EDT 

To: "Richard Kahn" 

Cc: 

=div style="margin-top: Opx; margin-right: Opx; margin-bottom: Opx; =argin-left: Opx;">Subject: RE: Dining =oom 

Hi =ich, 

Marc leaves for Nepal this =riday and I will make sure he discusses expediting this order with our =roduction 
manager. 

Please call me if you have any =ther questions. 

6TH FLOOR 
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