
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Thursday, Oct 
To: Merwin Dela Cruz 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: Estimate from Prime Renovations & Painting (Estimate #: EST-1171) 

when =ill we receive that proposal? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Oct 11, 2018, at 5:34 PM, Merwin Dela cruz Ini nla wrote: 

Do you want to wait for the other proposal from the company next door =efore we schedule Vinny or just 
schedule anyway? 

Thanks 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone chttps://overview.mail.yahoo.com/?.src=iOS> 

On Thursday, October =1, 2018, 4:59 PM, Richard Kahn 

thank you 
merwin please call =inny and ask when they can begin and how long it will take.. 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK =ssociates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 

ote: 
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On Oct 11, 2018, at 11:29 AM, =aryna Shuliak 

Mr. Epstein said ok to proceed 

rote: 

Begin forwarded =essage: 

From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Estimate from Prime =enovations & Painting (Estimate #: EST-1171) 

Date: October 11, 2018 at 11:16:17 AM EDT 

To:=Karyna Shuliak ear="none" class="yiv7079317862"> 

Ok 

On Thu, Oct 11, 2018 at 10:44 AM 

1171) 

<richardkahn12@gmail.com> 

=rote: 

Begin forwarded =essage: 

From: Merwin Dela cruz ,

Subject: Fwd: Estimate from Prime Renovations & =ainting (Estimate #: EST-

Date: October 10, 2018 at 8:14:21 =M EDT 

To: Karyna Shuliak 

Below is a quote from Vinny. 

Thanks 

Merwin =ela Cruz 

=Richard Kahn 
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Begin forwarded =essage: 

From: "VINNY B." 
Dat •14 PM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Estimate from Prime Renovations & Painting =Estimate #: EST-1171) 

Dear =ustomer, 

Thanks for your business enquiry. 

The estimate EST-1171 is attached with this =mail. 

We can get started if you send us your consent. =or any assistance you can 
reach us via email or phone. 

looking forward to hearing back from you. Here's =n overview of the estimate 
for your reference. 

Estimate Overview: 
Estimate # : EST-1171 
Date : 10/10/18 
Amount : $8,700.00 

Regards 
Prime Renovations & Painting 

=div class="yiv7079317862" style="word-wrap:break-word;"> 

please note 

The =nformation contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, =ay 
constitute inside =nformation, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property =f 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of =his 
communication or any part =hereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received =his 
communication in error, =lease notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and =11 copies thereof, 
including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights =eserved 
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