From: Karyna Shuliak < G
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 6:07 PM

To: W Bella Klein; Daphne Wallace
Subject: wd: itchen fabric

Good afternoon Bella, Daphn= and Seth,

Seth and | were working on the fabric o=der for L5J kitchen banquet. | forwarded below Seth's email with th= final
invoice and the credit card form.

Please review for accura=y. If all is correct, Bella could you please process the payment?

Thank you all very much!

Karyna

Begi= forwarded message:

From -

Date: July 25, 2018 at 12:40:09 P\ EDT
=b>To: Karyna Shulia
Subject: RE: Jeffrey E

Hi Karyna,

Yes it is.

Quote revised.</=pan>

Please include a contact pe=son and tel. phone number for LSJE.

Also, please advise your Fe=Ex acct. for shipping the order to USVI on,
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Thank you,

Seth

Seth Pariser

Senior Vice President</=:p>
Christopher Hyland Incorpora=ed
D & D Building

579 Third Avenue, Suit= 1710

New York, NY 10022

=mailto:seth@christopherhyland.=et> / www.christopherhyland.=om <http://www.christopherhyland.com> / Follow
us on Instagram @christopherhylandine <https://www.instagram.com/christopherhylandinc/>

From: Karyna Shul=ak [mailto:karynashuliak@icloud=com
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 12:31 PM

To: Seth Pariser

Subject: Re: leffrey Epstein order

Good afternoon Seth,
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The revised amount of fabric for the order is 40 yard=.

Ship to:

L5SJE, LLC

6100 Red Hook Quarters, suite B-3 </=>

St. Thomas, USVI 00802

Could you please adjust the quote given the above.&nb=p;

Also, just want to check if the country of origin is I=aly? We would need to know it for the customs.

Once | have your invoice, | will put you in touch wit= two of my colleagues who will take care of the payment.

Thank you very much!

Karyna

On Jul 24, 2018, at 5:24 PM, Seth Pariser _=te:

Tomorrow is a new day Karyn=,
Have a nice evening.=o:p=

Regards,<=p>
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Seth

Seth Pariser

Senior Vice President=o:p>
Christopher Hyland Incorpora=ed

D & D Building

579 Third Avenue, Suite 1710=/span>

New York, NY 10022

<
=span style="font-size:9.0pt;font-family:"Calibri","sans-se=if";color:#1F497D">/ Instagram@christopherhylandin=

From: Karyna Shuliak |

Sent: Tuesday, July=24, 2018 4:40 PM
To: Seth Pariser

Subject: Re: Jeffre= Epstein order

Hi Seth,

| am still waiting for the answer on the correct amous=t of fabric. | assume we will not be able to process the
order today, hopef=lly tomorrow.

Sorry for the delay.
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Thank you,
Karyna
Hi Karyna,
Here is the information for=now.
Please confirm that in orde=ing 60 yards, you realize the width of the fabric is 118 Inches.
My best,<=p>

Seth

Seth Pariser

Senior Vice President=0:p>
Christopher Hyland Incorpora=ed

D & D Building

979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710=/span=

New York, NY 10022
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=span style="font-size:9.0pt;font-family:"Calibri","sans-se=if";color:#1F497D">/ Follow us on Instagram=/b>
@christo=herhylandinc <https://ww=.instagram.com/christopherhylandinc/>

From: Karyna Shuliak

Sent: Tuesday, July=24, 2018 12:19 PM
To: Seth Pariser

Subject: Jeffrey Ep=tein order

Client name: Mr. leffrey Epstein
Ship to:
Mr. leffrey Epstein

9 E 71st Street, New York, NY 10021

Bill to:
JSC interiors, LLC
575 Lexington ave, 4th floor

New York, NY 10022

=141655.pdf>

<CREDIT CARD AUTHORIZATION FORM. pdf==/p=
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