From: Karyna Shuliak
Sent: Wednesday, Jul , :

To: Bella Klein
Subject: Re: JSC Interiors LLC - Bid No. B988933 - July 24, 2018

Thank you Bella!

=br>0n Jul 25, 2018, at 12:43 PM, Bella Klein _ > wrote:

Good Afternoon Ryan,
Attached please find cred=t card authorization form. Please process order and provide delivery time.<=div>

<Amex_LSJE_Ferguson Enterprises_Ame= authorization_33,448.42 072518.pdf=

Thank you,
Bella

Tel:=span class="Apple-tab-span” style="white-space: pre;"> 212-=71-1307

On J=I 24 2018 at 6:36 PM, I NG

wrote:

<mailto:

Hello,&nb=p;

Attached is the revised quot=, | was able to remove the freight, | have the correct tax amount, |
also a=ded that it is manufactured in Germany. |'ve also attached a c= form if you'd like to fill it out and send it back or
give me a ca=l. have a nice night!

-Ryan

From: Daphne Wallace <

Sent: Tuesday, July 24, 2018 3:53 PM

To: Jor=ensen, Ryan [Ferguson] - 2625 New York _
I - ¢l iein  Karyna Shulak <=2

R 5 ty|e="color: rgh(149, 79, 114=; text-decoration: underline;"
class="{ NN  -::-''>subject:

Greetings Ryan,

=div class="">

As promised, the delivery address=to Florida is as follows:

=div style="margin: Oin Oin 0.0001pt; font-size: 11pt; font-family: Calibr=, sans-serif;" class="">
Tropical Shipping

EFTA_R1_01192923
EFTA02309813



9505 NW 108th Avenue
< =jv>
Medley, FL 33178

Please do not hesi=ate to let us know if you need additional information.
&nbs=;

Thank you and k=nd regards,

Daphne

<=blockquote=

&|=;CREDIT CARD AUTHORIZATION FORM.DOC>
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