
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: 

Megan Carlesi < 
Friday, August 17, 2018 5:21 PM 

Molly S. Roberg; hesaintjames.group@gmail.com 
FW: L51 Cabana Tiles/ 579909 

Hi all, Though this is shipping to Miami, our shipping department is asking for the following to procure the invoice you 
need: 

In order to proceed with commercial invoice, I will need the following information: 

1. Ultimate Consignee full name and business name (if applicable) 
2. Ultimate Consignee address 
3. Contact at Tropical Shipping so I can communicate for booking details so I may file AES with customs 

Please advise as soon as possible. 

Thanks. 

Megan 

<http://www.artistictile.com/> 
Megan Carlesi 
Project Manager 

Artistic Tile Inc <http://ArtisticTile.com> 
520 Secaucus Road Secaucus, NJ 07094 

<http://twitter.com/artistic_tile> chttp://instagram.com/artistic_tile> chttps://houzz.com/pro/artistictile520> 
<http://facebook.com/artistictile> <http://pinterest.com/artistictile> 
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From: Molly S. Roberg 
Sent: Friday, Augus • 
To: Megan Carlesi 
Subject: RE: LSJ Cabana Tiles/ 579909 

Please see below. 

579909, JSC 

Many thanks! 

<http://www.artistictile.com/> 

Molly Roberg 
Design Associate 

Artistic Tile Inc <http://ArtisticTile.com> 
150 East 58th Street, 9th Floor, New York, NY 10155 

<http://twitter.com/artistic_tile> chttp://instagram.com/artistic_tile> <https://houzz.com/pro/artistictile520> 
<http://facebook.com/artistictile> <http://pinterest.com/artistictile> 

For delivery status or concerns please contact my Project Manager Kymberli C. Gann•Hoolahan at or 

From: brice gordon 
Sent: Friday, August 
To: Molly S. Rober 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak 
<thesaintjames.group@gmail.com <mailto:thesaintjames.group@gmail.com» 
Subject: Re: LSJ Cabana Tiles 
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hi there 

we will need the same information on this invoice as well 

any updates regarding delivery? 

regards Brice 

On Tue, Jul 31, 2018 at 4:22 PM, Molly S. Roberg < 
> wrote: 

Hi Brice, 

Please see attached quote & tear sheets for your review. In regards to freight is a lift gate and/or inside delivery 
needed? 

Based on today's inventory I have stock of Brush Stroke Oyster and Glacial Polar White is on back-order. Next 
shipment arrives in September. In order to secure materials a 50% deposit would be required. Does this fit in your 
project's time frame? 

Thanks, 

Molly 

chttp://www.artistictile.com/> 

Molly Roberg 
Design Associate 

Artistic Tile Inc <http://ArtisticTile.com> 
150 East 58th Street, 9th Floor, New York, NY 10155 
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<http://twitter.com/artistic_tile> <http://instagram.com/artistic_tile> <https://houzz.com/pro/artistictile520> 
<http://facebook.com/artistictile> <http://pinterest.com/artistictile> 

For delivery status or concerns please contact my Project Manager Kymberli C. Gann-Hoolahan at • or 

From: Molly S. Roberg 
Sent: Tuesday, July 31 2018 12:53 PM 
To: 'brice gordon' < 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak 

<thesaintjames.group@gmail.com <mailto:thesaintjames.group@gmail.com» 
Subject: RE: LSJ Cabana Tiles 

Thanks Brice. I'll get back to you with a quote. 

<http://www.artistictile.com/> 

Molly Roberg 
Design Associate 

Artistic Tile Inc <http://ArtisticTile.com> 
150 East 58th Street, 9th Floor, New York, NY 10155 

; LSJ GSJ 

<http://twitter.com/artistic_tile> <http://instagram.com/artistic_tile> <https://houzz.com/pro/artistictile520> 
<http://facebook.com/artistictile> <http://pinterest.com/artistictile> 

For delivery status or concerns please contact my Project Manager Kymberli C. Gann-Hoolahan at 919-803-3340 or 
kymberlihoolahan@artistictile.com <mailto:kymberlihoolahan@artistictile.com> 

From: brice gordon 
Sent: Tuesday, July 31, 2018 12:05 PM 
To: Molly S. Roberg <-
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Cc: Karyna Shuliak L.S1GSJ 
<thesaintjames.group@gmail.com <mailto:thesaintjames.group@gmail.com» 

Subject: Re: LSJ Cabana Tiles 

As requeste, attached shipping information 

On Tue Jul 31 2018 at 11:39 AM, Molly S. Rober 
> wrote: 

Hi Brice, 

Will you please send me the full ship to address. 

Thank you! 

<http://www.artistictile.comk 

Molly Roberg 
Design Associate 

Artistic Tile Inc <http://ArtisticTile.com> 
150 East 58th Street, 9th Floor, New York, NY 10155 
<htt m aos. aooale.com .150+East+58th+Street,-P9th+Floor,+New+York,+NY+10155&entry=gmail&source=g> 

<http://twitter.com/artistic_tile> <http://instagram.com/artistic_tile> <https://houzz.com/pro/artistictile520> 
<http://facebook.com/artistictile> <http://pinterest.com/artistictile> 

For delivery status or concerns please contact my Project Manager Kymberli C. Gann-Hoolahan at 919-803-3340 or 
kymberlihoolahan@artistictile.com <mailto:kymberlihoolahan@artistictile.com> 

From: brice gordon 
Sent: Tuesday, July 31 2018 11:35 AM 
To: Molly S. Roberg 
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Cc: Karyna Shuliak LS1 GS1 
<thesaintjames.group@gmail.com <mailto:thesaintjames.group@gmail.com» 

Subject: LS1 Cabana Tiles 

Hi Molly 

Attached photo for your Reference 

as discussed we would like proceed with ordering the following qty's of tile 

Brush Strokes PBSOY1224 Textured Field Oyster (Floor) Qty- 170 Sqft 

Glacial Collection GGLPOWHGL24 Glacial Polar White , Gloss Qty-900 Sqft 

any concerns please let me know 

regards 

Brice Gordon 

The Saint James Group 

USVI 

Ph: ( 

Brice Gordon 

The Saint James Group 

USVI 
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Brice Gordon 

The Saint James Group 

USVI 

Ph: (340) 201 9533 
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