
From: 
Sent: Tuesday, June 26, 2012 5:55 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: floors at 10b and 10f 

About to take off for ny. Y=u can try me in the next 10-15 min I should be available 

<=div> 

On Jun 26, 2012, at 6:16 AM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

can you call me when you have a=minute to discuss 
thanks 

<=pan class="Apple-style-span" style="border-collapse: separate; color: r=b(0, 0, 0); font-family: Helvetica; font-
style: normal; font-variant: norma=; letter-spacing: normal; line-height: normal; orphans: 2; text-align: -web=it-auto; 
text-indent: Opx; text-transform: none; white-space: normal; widow=: 2; word-spacing: Opx; -webkit-border-horizontal-
spacing: 0px; -webkit-bor=er-vertical-spacing: Opx; -webkit-text-decorations-in-effect: none; -webkit=text-size-adjust: 
auto; -webkit-text-stroke-width: Opx; font-size: medium; "= 

<=iv style="font-weight: normal; ">PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH MY CON=ACT INFO WILL BE AS FOLLOWS: 
=br> 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
=/span> 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
N=w York, New York 10022 

tel 

fax 
cell 
=/span> 

On Jun 25, 2012, at 7:03 PM, wrote: 
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10F was 2700 for the country white finish. Anthony took care o= replacing all the new wood flooring, but 
we chose a finish that was more e=pensive than what Anthony has been choosing for his own apts, so we aquired=the 
extra cost for the finish. 

On Jun 25, 2012, at 11:35 AM, R=chard Kahn < 
<mailto: >  wrote: 

bella j=st presented me with a 4985.25 invoice for the 10f floor and 2709.38 floor<=div> 
please advise 
thank you 

<=iv> 
PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH M= CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS FOLLOWS: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
<=div> 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, =br>New York, New York 10022 

tel 

fax 
cell 
<=span> 
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