
From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Monday, July 2, 2018 6:54 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: Amex Black_WAYFARE credit received on black card!! All is GOOD!! 

Still did not received credit for $500 from Quality Bath Thank you, Bella 

> On Jul 2, 2018, at 2:51 PM, Karyna Shuliak <karynashuliak@icloud.com> =rote: 

> Great, thank you Bella! 

» On Jul 2, 2018, at 11:19 AM, Bella Klein wrote: 

» HI Karyna, 
» Warfare issued credit to the black card instead of Blue! SO all is =ood. 

» <Summary-2.xls> 
» Thank you, 
» Bella 
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