
From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 6:13 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Cc: Daphne Wallace 
Subject: Re: LSJ kitchen fabric 

Karyna, 
Please resend attachment 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Jul 25, 2018, at 2:06 PM, Karyna Shuliak rote: 

Good afternoon Bella, Daphne and Seth, 

Seth and I were working on the fabric =rder for LSJ kitchen banquet. I forwarded below Seth's email =ith the 
final invoice and the credit card form. 

Please review for accuracy. If all is correct, Bella could =ou please process the payment? 
Daphne, could you =lease send our Fedex account to Seth, so that he can have it shipped =irectly to St. Thomas? 

Also, in case you need, the country of origin is =taly. 

Thank =ou all very much! 

Karyna 

Begin =orwarded message: 

From: Seth =arise 
Date: July 25, 2018 at 12:40:09 PM EDT 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: RE: Jeffrey Epstein order 
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Hi Karyna, 

Yes it is. 

Quote revised. 

Please include a contact person and =el. phone number for LSJE. 

Also, please advise your FedEx acct. =or shipping the order to USVI on. 

Thank you, 

Seth 

Seth Pariser 

Senior Vice President 

Christopher Hyland Incorporated 

D & D Building 

979 Third Avenue, Suite =710 

New York, NY =0022 

www.christopherhyland.com Follow us on Instagram @christopherhylandinc 
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From Karyna shoal, 
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 12:31 PM 
To: Seth Pariser 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein order 

Good afternoon Seth, 

The revised amount of fabric for =he order is 40 yards. 

Ship to: 

LSJE, LLC 

6100 Red Hook Quarters, suite B-3 =nbsp; 

St. Thomas, USVI 00802 

Could you please adjust the quote =iven the above. 

Also, just want to check if the =ountry of origin is Italy? We would need to know it for the =ustoms. 

Once I have your invoice, I will =ut you in touch with two of my colleagues who will take care of the 
=ayment. 

Thank you very much! 

Karyna 

On Jul 24, 2018, at 5:24 PM, 
> wr . 
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Tomorrow is a new day =aryna. 

Have a nice evening. 

Regards, 

Seth 

Seth Pariser 

Senior Vice President 

Christopher Hyland =ncorporated 

D & D Building 

979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 

New York, NY 10022 

www.christopherhyland.com / Follow us on Instagram@christopherhylandint 

From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Tuesday, July 
To: Seth Pariser 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein =rder 
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Hi Seth, 

I am still waiting for the answer =n the correct amount of fabric. I assume we will not be able to process 
=he order today, hopefully tomorrow. 

Sorry for the delay. 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

On Jul 24, 2018, at 12:50 PM, Seth Pariser wrote: 

Hi Karyna, 

Here is the information for =ow. 

Please confirm that in ordering 60 =ards, you realize the width of the fabric is 118 Inches. 

My best, 

Seth 

Seth Pariser 

Senior Vice President 
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Christopher Hyland =ncorporated 

O & D Building 

979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 

New York, NY 10022 

www.christopherhyland.com / Follow us on Instagram @christopherhylandinc 

From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Tuesday, July 24, 2018 =2:19 PM 
To: Seth Pariser 
Subject: Jeffrey Epstein =rder 

Client name: Mr. Jeffrey =pstein 

Ship to: 

Mr. Jeffrey Epstein 

9 E 71st Street, New York, NY =0021 

Bill to: 

JSC interiors, LLC 

575 Lexington ave, 4th floor 

New York, NY 10022 

<141655.pdf> 

<CREDIT CARD AUTHORIZATION =ORM.pdf> 
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