
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, August 13, 2018 5:38 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak; Richard Kahn; bellaklein 
Subject: Re: Artefacto deposit 

20k as a deposit on future furniture purchases. 
=/div> 

On Mon, Aug=13, 2018 at 1:08 PM, Karyna Shuliak =t; wrote: 

Good afternoon Bella an= Rich, 

We started working with the design team from Artefacto furniture store for =he project on the island and Palm 
Beach. They need a $20,000 deposit by cr=dit card. Attached below is a cc authorization form. Could you please fill=it 
out and send to Ezequiel (he is the person from Artefacto who is workin= with us). I will send a separate email, where he 
will be included. 

Jeffrey is aware and has approved the payment. 

Thank you very much! 

Karyna 

Sent with Genius Scan for iOS. 
http://dl.tglapp.com/genius-scan <http://dl.tglapp.com/genius-scan> 

=AO please note 

The information conta=ned in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privi=eged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for th= use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
d=sclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strict=y prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communic=tion in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-ma=l to 
jeevacatio=@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies 
thereot<=r>including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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