From: Karyna Shuliak

Sent: Thursday, October 25, 2018 2:49 PM

To: Bella Klein

Cc: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: LSJE_WT _Institut Villa Pierrefeu_Summer course for Karyna_34510 CHF_102518.pdf

Tha=k you so much!

Wire sent

=blockquote type="cite">
<LSJE_WT _Institut Villa Pierre=eu_Summer course for Karyna_34510 CHF_102518.pdf>

Thank you,
Bella

Tel:=span class="Apple-tab-span” style="white-space: pre;"> 212-=71-1307

On O=t 24, 2018, at 4:49 PM, Richard Kahn |

wrote:

please pay from JEE
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexin=ton Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

EFTA_R1_01193708
EFTA02310249



Subject:
Date: <=pan style="font-family: -webkit-system-font, Helvetica Neue, Helvetica, s=ns-serif;"
class=""=0ctober 24, 2018 at 3:55:15 PM EDT

Cc: Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com==

Hi Rich,

Jeffrey asked if you could please pay the total of CHF 34'510=00 via bank transfer. Attached below is the
invoice from the school with th= wire instructions.

Karyna

<=div=>
<GUID-5844 A=c-01-INV-C5-2019-6W06 2018-10-22 PN _SHULIAK Karyna.pdf>

</=jy=

EFTA_R1_01193709
EFTA02310250



