
From: Karyna Shuliak < 
Sent: Monday, August 13, 2018 8:09 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Cc: Daphne Wallace 
Subject: Re: new fabric order for LSJ 

Hi Bella, 

I sent en email just now, that has a payment form attached. If you want =o give her the card now, it is fine. We just don't 
know the =inal cost yet, it will depend on the shipping method. 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

> On Aug 13, 2018, at 4:00 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> Should i pay before delivery, please confirm Thank you, Bella 

» On Aug 13, 2018, at 3:56 PM, Karyna Shuliak 

» Good afternoon Daphne and Bella, 

wrote: 

» I am ordering fabric from Kravet, that will need to go to LS.I. 
» I will include you on the email with Bonnie, who I was working with =n that order. Daphne, could you please send her 
the shipping info, so =hat she can put together an invoice? 
» Bella, once we have the invoice, could you please send the payment? 

» Thank you! 

» Karyna 
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