
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Friday, June 15, 2012 11:48 PM 
To: Kim Steube 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: Dining room 

Quote was 39,289 
I will send paperwork on Monday as I have left my office Thank you 

On 6/15/12 6:33 PM, "Kim Steube' wrote: 

>Rich, 
>Marc is leaving for hong kong this weekend and I want to get this 
>resolved and get this order in production before he leaves. Please 
>confirm the quote was from TP was $39k so I can amend my paperwork 
>tonight. 

>Thanks, 

>Kim Steube 
>Sacco Car et Cor 
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