From: I

Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject: RE: Re: JSC Interiors LLC - Bid No. B988933 - July 24, 2018

Hi Daphne,

Do you want me to ship it to 6100 red hook quarter B3? | originally had the ship to address as 9505 N'W 108TH AVENUE
in Miami?

Let me know which you'd like it sent to.

-Ryan

From: Daphne Wallace <G

Sent: Thursday, September &, 2018 11:48 AM

To: Bella Klein : brice gordon _; L5) GSJ

=3
Cc: Jorgensen, Ryan [Ferguson] - 2625 New York «:_; Karyna Shuliak
I -

Subject: [EXT] Re: JSC Interiors LLC - Bid No. B988933 - July 24, 2018

Greetings Ryan,

As promised, | would like for you to ship out as soon as possible the order that has arrived. Thank you for having it
expedited so it arrived ahead of the 9/18 estimation.

We understand that there is one line item missing - D35080970900010 - when that arrives, email us and we will have
you FedEx it to us on our account.
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Please change the Ship To from JSC Interiors LLC to LSJE, LLC - ST. THOMAS

The address of 6100 Red Hook Quarter B3 can remain.

When you have the tracking number to Tropical Shipping, please email it to us and we will track it on our end as well.
Kind regards, Daphne

On Wed, Jul 25, 2018 at 12:43 PM Bella Klein J TN > rote:

Good Afternoon Ryan,

Attached please find credit card authorization form. Please process order and provide delivery time.

Thank you,
Bella

wrote:

Hello,

Attached is the revised quote, | was able to remove the freight, | have the correct tax amount, | also
added that it is manufactured in Germany. I've also attached a cc form if you'd like to fill it out and send it back or give
me a call. have a nice night!
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-Ryan

Sent: Tuesday, July 24, 2018 3:53 PM

To: Jorgensen, Ryan [Ferguson] - 2625 New York
<mailto: =: Bella Klein <

Karyna Shuliak

ubject: [EXT] J5C Interiors LLC - Bi Q.

Greetings Ryan,

As promised, the delivery address to Florida is as follows:

Tropical Shipping

9505 N'W 108th Avenue

Medley, FL 33178

Please do not hesitate to let us know if you need additional information.

Thank you and kind regards,

Daphne
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