
From: > 
Sent: Thursday, June 21, 2012 2:49 PM 
To: 
Cc: Anthony barett 
Subject: Re: 8h 

Thanks Penn. Yes, please proceed with this. Can you send me a photo of the p=ttern of the grill as well? Are there 
options for the grill pattern? 

On Jun 21, 2012, at 6:52 AM, wrote: 

> Hi M, the price for the radiator cover is $1000 for each x 2 is 
> $2000 p=us grilles $600. Total is $2600 labor and materials. Please 
> confirm so that=we can do it today till tomorrow. Penn Sent from my 
> Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 
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