
From: 
Sent: Friday, July 6, 2012 6:28 PM 
To: Grace Vele 
Subject: Re: Permit to export 

> 

Dear Grace, 
I sent US$250 yesterday. Thank you again so much for getting this done. I have given Paul the info to pick it up. 
Best 

 Original Message 
From: Grace Vele 
Sent: Wednesday, July 04, 2012 10:33 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: Permit to export 

Hi =I, 

I just came back from TNT. I have paid for the Package. Just inform Paul that the consignment No. is GE734848262WW. 
I forgot his phone number, so I did not include it on the receipt. So he should just use the consignment number to pick 
up the permits from TNT Wewak. 

Cheers! 

Gracey 

On 7/5/12, > wrote: 
> Dear Grace, 
> It is a public holiday today I will send $100 into your account tomorrow. 
> Thanks so much for getting this done. 
> Best 

> Original Message 
> From: Grace Vele 
> Sent: Monda , July 02, 2012 6:47 PM 
> To: 
> Subject: Re: Permit to export 

> Hi 

> I have just viewed the images and prepared the permits for Andrew's 
> signature and Mr. Greh. In the Board of Trustees last meeting last 
> year, they have changed policies and now we have two nominee's signing 
> the permits. So as soon as I get them both sign the permits, I will 
> get to TNT and get the necessary costings for sending the permits to 
> Paul asap. But if you think I should just go ahead and get them to 
> TNT then here is my account particulars - Account Name: Grace Vele, 
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> Bank: Bank South Pacific, Branch: Waigani, Account #: 

> Ta, 

> Grace 

> On 6/13/12, > wrote: 
» Dear Grace, 
» Here is what I sent to Andrew. 
» Thanks and I hope you are feeling better soon. 

» Dear Andrew, 
» Congratulations on coming through all the mess that has been 
» happening. I hope this election goes smoothly and the nastiness gets 
» resolved. I don't know the details but it seems that Sir Michael was 
» treated poorly with lack of respect and grace. 
» I have been trying to get 40 Kwoma pungal from Ambunti for nearly a 
» year for a client who fell in love with the Haus Boi at the Met. 
» Museum in New York. 
» They are at last in Wewak and I attach photographs for a permit to 
» export them. They are going to go airfreight to the client in Florida. 
» Two shields were also made for National Geographic who are mounting 
» an exhibit on Bird of Paradise in September and wanted two large 
» shields for the entrance way. As they are to be shipped separately I 
» would like to get two separate permits. 
» My brother Paul is building plywood crates for the pieces ready to 
» go. I have been threatened with a law suit if I don't deliver them by 
» June 30 as it has taken so long. I would appreciate your early 
» attention. 
» Best 

> --
> gracev.guise 

gracev.guise 
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