
From: Karyna Shuliak 
Sent: Wednesday, December 5, 2018 8:23 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: Daphne Wallace; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: 253970 stark carpet order 

Tha=k you! 

On Dec 5, 2018, at 12:35 PM, Richard Kahn &=t 
wrote: 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexin=ton Avenue 4th Floor 

On D=c 5, 2018, at 1:32 PM, Daphne Wallace < 
> wrote: 

Greetings=Rich, 

I spoke with Tenz=ng. The FL Sales tax will be credited once I produce proof of export i= the form of the 
BOL. 

<=r class=""> 

 Forwarded message -
From: =enzing Nepali 
Date: Wed, Dec 5, 2018 at 12:28 PM 
Subject: RE: 25=970 stark carpet order 

hn• ilerrIEMME2, Karyna Shu=iak 

Cc: Rich Kahn 

EFTA_R1_01199072 
EFTA02311866



Hi 0=phne, 

&=bsp; I received your voicemail, I am wanted to send you the estimate before=l call you. 

&n=sp; =nbsp; &nbs=; 

Best regards 

Tenzing Nepalig=pan> 

<http://www.starkcarpet.comh 

979 Third Avenue, 11th Floor &=bsp; I New York, NY 10022 
www.starkcarpet.com <http://www.starkcarpet.com/> 
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<https://ww=.twitter.com/starkcarpet> <image004.png>=/a> <https://www.facebook.com/starkcar=et> 

Sent: Wednesday, December 05, 2018 11:46 AM 
=To: Karyna Shuliak 
Cc: Rich Kahn < eionassiskroassairayariesist >; Tenzing Nep=li < 

Subject: Re: 253970 stark carpet orde 

Greetings Karyna and Tenzing, 

Based on the size of the rug, Tropica= Shipping will be the most efficient option. 

The delivery address will be: 

Tropical Shipping 

9505 NW 108th Avenue 

Medley, FL 33178 

Consignee: JSC Interiors, LLC - ST. T=OMAS 
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Thank you and kind regards, Daphne 

t 10:38 AM Karyn= Shuliak < 
wrote: 

Good morning Tenzing, Daphne and Rich, 

Please see below the estimate for the rug from Tenzing. 
Rich, could you please work with Tenzing on the payment. 
Daphne, if you could please coordinate with Tenzing the shipping process to S=.Thomas. 

Thank you very much! 

Karyna 

<253970 Karyna St Thomas.Pdf><Credit Card Authorization Form= STARK (fillable).pdf> 
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