
From: Daphne Wallace < 
Sent: Tuesday, January 29, 2019 3:38 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: Chair for LSJE - January 24, 2019 

Greetings Karyna, 

Sorry I did not=C2tet back to you sooner. Carluz had already delivered the chairs=to the port. I created an invoice for 
the value of $500 to get them shippe=. 

I will ask Stephanie to forward photos to you o=ce the chairs arrive. 

Kind regards, Daphnec/=iv> 

On Fri, Jan 25, 2019 at 1:07 AM Karyna Shuliak <mailto 
wrote: 

Hi Daphne, 

I am not sure what chair he has delivered. are they four teak chairs? Could=he send a picture of the label and a package 
please? 

Thank you, 

Karyna 

> On Jan 24, 2019, at 5:48 PM, Daphne Wallace < > wrote: 

> Greetings Karyna, 

> Do you have the invoice for the chair that Carluz delivered to Tropica= Shipping today? 

> Kind regards, 

> Daphne 
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