
From: Karyna Shuliak < 
Sent: Tuesday, November 20, 2018 6:06 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: 11/01/2018 RESTORATION HARDWARE 3,017.40 

Hi Bella, 
It's for LSJ. Just forwarded to you the email with the receipt. 
Thank you. 

> On Nov 20, 2018, at 11:31 AM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> Hi Karyna, 
> For what house is the above purchase 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 
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