
From: Karyna Shuliak <

Sent: Tuesday, March 19, 2019 2:55 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Amex Blue March 15 Statement 

Hi Bella, 
The charge from the Conran shop is housewares for both PB and LSJ. 
Thank you, 
Karyna 

> On Mar 19, 2019, at 8:47 AM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> Hi Karyna, 
> Your Amex Blue is attached. Please confirm charges and help with property a=location. Please confirm charge from 
Conran is the amount of $12721.35 

> <Amex_Blue_Karyna Statement Mar 15 2019.xls> 

> Thank you, 
> Bella 

> Tel: 
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