From: Tenzing Nepali

Sent: Thursday, November 8, 2018 3:45 PM
To: Karyna Shuliak

Cc: Richard Kahn

Subject: RE: 240308 JSC Shuliak Library.Pdf

Hi Karyna and Richard,
| hope all is well. Just checking in to see how you like the new carpet?

Let me know if you have any questions and if there is anything else | can help you with.

Best regards

Tenzing Nepali
Account Manager

<http://www.starkcarpet.com/>

—ww.starkcarpet.com <http://www.starkcarpet.com>

<https://www.instagram.com/starkcarpet> <https://www twitter.com/starkcarpet>
<https://www.facebook.com/starkcarpet>

From: Karyna Shuliak
Sent: Wednesday, October
To: Tenzing Mepali

Cc: Merwin Dela cruz Richard Kahn _ Bella Klein
Tamdn e
Subject: Re: 240308 J5C Shuliak Library.Pd

31 2018 6:46 PM

Thank you Tenzing,

On Oct 31, 2018, at 6:07 PM, Tenzing Nepa! | o

Hi all,
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We will be there for delivery between 12:00- 3:00 tomorrow for delivery. | will be Chicago on a business trip but
will have access to my email if you need anything.

Best
Tenzing

Sent from my iPhone

wrote:
Hi Richard,

Please see attached balance due and advise if it is ok to charge the card ending in 2008.

Best regards

Tenzing Nepali
Account Manager

<image001.png> <http://www.starkcarpet.com/>

www.starkcarpet.com <http://www.starkcarpet.com>
<image002.png> <https://www.instagram.com/starkcarpet> <image003.png>
<https://www twitter.com/starkcarpet> <image004.png> <https://www.facebook.com/starkcarpet>

From: Merwin Dela cruz |

Sent: Monday, October 29, 2018 5:33 PM
To: Karyna Shulia

Cc: Tenzing Mepali Bella Klein

Subject: Re: 240308 I5C Shuliak Library. Pdf

Richard Kahn
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Thanks

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone <https://overview.mail.yahoo.com/?.src=i05>

On Monday, October 29, 2018, 5:32 PM, Karyna Shuliak _
I, o=

Thank you.

On Oct 29, 2018, at 5:07 PM, Richard kahn ||| GG

dates 11/01 and 11/02 are confirmed

thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

On Oct 29, 2018, at 4:39 PM, Tenzing Nepali_

Hi Richard and Karyna,

We can deliver on Thursday 11/01 and install 11/02 and continue on Monday if
needed. Please let me know if you approve.

EFTA_R1_01202025
EFTA02312916



Best regards

Tenzing Nepali
Account Manager

<image001.png> <http://www.starkcarpet.com/>

www . starkcarpet.com <http://www.starkcarpet.com/>
<image002.png> <https://www.instagram.com/starkcarpet> <image003.png>
<https://www.twitter.com/starkcarpet> <image004.png> <https://www.facebook.com/starkcarpet>

From: Tenzing Nepali |

Sent: Monday, October 29, 2018 8:31 AM

To: Richard kahn

Cc: Bella Klein Karyna Shuliak

Subject: Re: 240308 J5C Shuliak Library.Pdf
Hi Richard,
Is there a date you prefer? We normally deliver one day and install the next.

Earliest we can deliver would be Wednesday.

Best

Tenzing

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 29, 2018, at 8:00 AM, Richard Kahn _
rote:
please advise when this carpet can be installed

thank you
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Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

On Oct 10, 2018, at 5:35 PM, Tenzing Mepali _

Thank you Bella!

Best regards

Tenzing Nepali
Account Manager

<image001.png> <http://www.starkcarpet.com/>

www.starkcarpet.com <http://www starkcarpet.com/>
<image002.png> <https://www.instagram.com/starkcarpet> <image003.png>
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From: Bella Klein |

Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2018 4:33 PM

7
Cc: Karyna Shuliak

Subject: Re: 240308 J5C Shuliak Library.Pdf

Hi Tenzing,
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Credit card authorization form and signed quote is attached.

Thank you,

Bella

On Oct 10, 2018, at 4:22 PM, Richard Kahn _
[

yes please install asap

thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

On Oct 10, 2018, at 3:41 PM, Tenzing Nepali_
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We have this in stock so | would say in 2-3 weeks we should be able to install. If
it's in a rush, let me know and | can see what can be done.

Best

Tenzing

On Oct 10, 2018, at 3:36 PM, Richard Kahn _
T .

thank you

my assistant bella will send credit card info shortly
what is time frame to receive?

please advise

thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

On Oct 10, 2018, at 3:24 PM, Tenzing Nepali _
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Hi Richard,

As per our conversation, here is the breakdown.

13°-2" x 79°-11" = 117 /sy x $143/5Y. The client did pick one of our more
expensive broadloom and would like the carpet to be wall to wall throughout his library and hallways.

Carpet - 516,720.00

Labor - 56,780.00

Please know | used the least expensive way of laying out the carpet and it has
multiple seams.

Please let me know what you decide.

Best regards

Tenzing Nepali
Account Manager

www.starkcarpet.com <http://www.starkcarpet.com/>
<image002.png> <https://www.instagram.com/starkcarpet> <image003.png>
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From: Richard kahn

Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2018 2:50 PM

To: Tenzing Nepali

Subject: Re: 240308 J5C Shuliak Library.Pdf

8
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i just left you a message
can you please call me

thank you

Richard Kahn

wrote:
Hi Karyna and Mr Kahn,

That is good news! Mr Kahn, please find attached cc form, we will need a 50%
deposit in order to proceed.

Best regards

Tenzing Nepali
Account Manager
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From: Karyna shuliak [

Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2018 1:12 PM

To: Tenzing Nepa i

ce: richard kahn |

Subject: 240308 JSC Shuliak Library.Pdf

I

Hello Tenzing,

Thank you very much for the samples. We would like to proceed with Astinn
white carpet. | attached below the estimate that you sent to me the other day.

My colleague Mr. Kahn is copied on this email. He will be working with you on
placing this order.

Thank you very much,

Karyna

<Credit Card Authorization Form- STARK (fillable).pdf=

<20181029185453815.pdf=>
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