
From: 1 <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Sunday, February 17, 2019 1:53 PM 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: 

Alex , awaiting a response - title insurance? =ax indemnities ? Guarantees , deposits? Escrow? When can we ex=ect an 
answer 

On Sun, Feb 17, 2019 at 9:20 AM Karyna Shuli=k <karynashuliak@icloud.comqa» wrote: 

crnailt°

Thank you so much f=r the flowers! So beautiful 

=AO please note 

The information contained in this=communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, mayconstitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the=addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or=copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibite= and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in err=r, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com<=a>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including=all attachments. 
copyright -all rights reserved 
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