From: e

Sent: Thursday, July 26, 2012 4:32 PM
To: Danny The Mover
Subject: Re: Tomorrow, Friday

OK, | will make sure the girl has cash. Her name is - - =ell is _Are we confirmed for tomorrow

at 3pm?
On Jul 26, 2012, at 12:23 PM, Danny The Mover wrote:

= | accept cash only sorry .
-1

= All about service

= Movers & Storage

> 35-18 191 st

> Flushing NY

> 11358
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>

-]
>0n Jul 26, 2012, at 11:20 AM, | 1 - - - <<
-

== Hi Danny,
== I'd like to confirm your men tomorrow for 3pm a icking up the following: There is a
picture, about 1.4 meters =n a length, 2 Lights about 0.9 meters in a length, Steamer for clothes =bout 1.2 meters in
length, a futon couch about 2 meters in a length and =lso 2 large pieces of luggage and a few small pieces of luggage, 3-4
=goxes of dishes and other misc things,

>> Taking it all m_
>> What is the best way for payment? May | pay with my credit card?

=> Thanks,

.- I —
>
>> On Jul 25, 2012, at 3:49 PM, Danny The Mover || NN ' ote:

S
e - my rates are 150.00 per hour 3 hour minimum includes 3 men
>»> =ruck , certificate of insurance , and moving pads,
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==> Danny

>>> All about service
=>> Movers & Storage
»>» 35-18 191 st

=>> Flushing NY

»»> 11358
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>>>On Jul 25, 2012, at 3:41 PV, [ < - ote:
-

>3
=>>> | am working on getting a list. There is an elevator at each of the =ocations.
>

=>>>0n Jul 25, 2012, at 1:38 PM, Danny The Mover wrote:

e e

>>>>> | might be able to squeeze you in ? | would need an exact list of =hat you need moved. Any stairs ?
e e

>=>>> Al about service

>>>>> Movers & Storage

»»>>> 35-18 191 st

==>=> Flushing NY

=2x=> 11358

=annn P

B

e

>>>>> 0n Jul 25, 2012, at 12:13 v, [ G < - - - t-:

e

>>>>>> Hi Danny,

»»>>>> Are you available this Friday to do a small move within the city? =he largest item is a 6ft long couch. Thereis a

small book shelf, =acuum, some personal items, etc. | would need you at 3pm Friday at 635 =. _

“Drking on getting =xact address) please let me know if you are available. Thanks.
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