
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Monday, August 13, 2012 8:13 PM 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: 

'Bella Klein; 
Re: EPSTEIN / ISC (alarm system) devis a demander 

Importance: High 

thank =ou for explanation 
i know 2002 contract discussed is appropriate =or history however i am sure pricing and technology have changed over 
=he last 10 years 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Aug 13, 2012, at 4:09 PM, Marie-Joseph Experton =rote: 

English summary of mail sent to =aldson (further to Bella's mail for =xplanations): 

<= class="MsoNormal">Valdson, Bella =equires to get a quote for the replacement of the whole alarm system, 
as well as a quote for =n annual maintenance contract. 

Reminder: =/span>an ISC =roposal for maintenance contract was received and discussed in 2002, without being 
finalized. See =roposal attached for info. NB: I don't know if the 2002 proposal concerned the = apartments or only the 
old one ??? the price was 3,850 euros VAT =xcluded / year. 

cern> 

From: Marie-Joseph Experton 
Sent: lundi 13 ao0t =012 21:01 
To: 'valdson cotrin' 
Cc: 'Bella Klein'; =Richard Kahn'; 
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Subject: EPSTEIN / ISC =alarm system) devis à demander 
Importance: =igh 

<= class="MsoNormal">Valdson, 

<= class="MsoNormal">Bella =emande d'obtenir d'ISC: 

&=bsp; un devis pour le =u>remplacement de tout le système de sécurité, 

(ii) &=bsp; ainsi qu'un =evis pour un contrat annuel de =aintenance. 

<= class="MsoNormal">Pour rappel, un =ontrat de maintenance avait été discuté avec ISC en février 2002, mais 
=1 n'y avait été donné aucune suite. Voir proposition en fichier attaché =NB : je ne sais pas si cette proposition 
concernait les 2 appartements ou seulement l'ancien ?? le prix était de 3.850 C =T/an). 

Meilleures =alutations. 

<= class="MsoAutoSig">Marie-Joseph =xperton 

Avocat au Barreau de Paris établi à Bruxelles 

<=em> 

From: bellaklein 
Sent: lundi 13 août =012 20:40 
To: 
Cc: Richard Kahn; valdson =otrin; 
Subject: Re: EPSTEIN / =SC (alarm system) devis - Remplacement d'une carte d'alimentation et de deux =atteries 
Importance: =igh 
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Ms Experton, can you get a quote for the replacement of the =ystem. It looks very expensive 1,400 Euros for 
repair. Two weeks ago they charged =87 Euros for repair. Also, if we would have a maintenance contract what =ould be 
the cost? 

Thank you 

=span><PropositionISCmaintenance2002.pdf> 
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