From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Friday, June 21, 2019 4:27 PM

To: Tsering Dolma

Cc: Karyna Shuliak; _ Bella Klein
Subject: Re: Nangsel

I =m glad that she is happy with the job We do not pay for =rial days however if you would like us to pay we can deduct
from your =ee..

Please advise

Thank =ou

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates =nc.

575 Lexington =venue, 4th Floor
Mew York, NY =0022

tel

fax

cell

On Jun 21, 2019, at 11:58 AM, Tsering Dolma _ wrote:

Good morning Richard,

| spoke with Nangsel yesterday and she told me everything is going very well and she is very happy with the job.

She mentioned to me that she didn't get paid for the two days trial that she did before which is 05/19 and 05/20
before she started the job.

So, | told her yesterday that | will get in touch with you about =t.

| would really appreciate if you could take care of those two =ays.

Thank you,
Tsering

Tsering Dolma
Placement Specialist
d.

Greenhouse Agcy, Lt
phone I - S
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Securing the best jobs for "Experienced, Well Trained, Career Minded, Household/Domestic =rofessionals”
**Please take a look at our always updated & =mmensely-helpful website: www.greenhousestaffing.com=/span>

See all of the new services we have to offer. Find Jobs, Share Stories and Meet Qur Staff.
All Comments & Suggestions are welcome & truly appreciated!

"Household/Domestic Staff & Those Who Employ News Articles From Around The World":
www.greenhousestaffing.com=blog

Write A Review | Leave a Comment | View Available Jobs | View Available Candidates
¥4¥Please see us on Facebook and give us a "like!!"

55 West 39th Street, Suite 308
New York, NY 10018
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