
From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Tuesday, April 30, 2019 1:41 PM 
To: CARLUZ TOYLO 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak; Renato 
Subject: Re: RMA109867- have sent thru Fed Ex yesterday 

Thank=you, please use your Amex for payment. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Apr 30, 2019, at 9:20 AM, CARLUZ TOYLO < > =rote: 

it will take 2-3 days to process 

Carluz Toylo 

Begin forwarded message: 

<mailto 

From: "Benderman, Rhonda" 
Date: 4/29/2019 
To• mailto " < 

Cc: "Snodgrass, Holly"
Subject: RMA109867 

Hi Carlos, 
I have attached shipping labels for your =onvenience. 
Please reference RMA109867 when sending your unit(s) =0: 

CARDIO PARTNERS 
1001 Flagpole Ct 
Brentwood TN 37027 

EFTA_R1_012 11295 
EFTA02315596



A PM/Calibration is =99. If the AED is unable to pass inspection due to internal issue =here is an 
inspection fee of $75 to cover labor. Please make sure that =he RMA number is clearly marked on the outside of the =ox. 

Your account is set up on credit card terms. If you could =ell me a good time to call and get that number 
on file I would =ppreciate it. Or if you would like to submit a credit application I am =appy to forward one of those to 
you. If you have any questions =lease don't hesitate to call or email. 

Have a great rest of your =ay. 

Thank=you, 

Rhonda =enderman 
Cardio Partners I Biomedical =ales & Support Coordinator 
1001 Flagpole Court, Brentwood TN =7027 

I Fax 
service@cardiopartners.com <mailto:service@cardiopartners.com> 
www.cardiopartners.com I www.aed.com 
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