
From: 
Sent: Friday, September 7, 2012 4:16 PM 
To: Milton Young 
Subject: Re: carpet for studio bedroom & closets installed 

HI Milton, 
The building will need a certificate of insurance. can you pls fax one =o 
building is OSSA Properties. what other info =o you need? 

On Sep 6, 2012, at 10:57 AM, > wrote: 

The managing company of the 

> Hello Milton.. just wondering what the final invoice is on this and 
> =hen we can schedule install. They measured on Tuesday of this week. Pls =et me know. thanks On Aug 30, 2012, at 
1:27 PM, Milton Young < > wrote: 

Attached is copy of order for wall-wall carpet in bedroom and =losets with approximate cost of $1499.00. Please 
sign where " X " =ppears at bottom of page and e-mail to me asap. 

Thank You 

Milton 

» http://www.abchome.com 
» http://www.abccarpet.com 
» http://www.abckitchennyc.com 
» http://www.abchomeandplanetfoundation.org 
» <20120830131743.pdf> 
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