
From: Karyna Shuliak < > 
Sent: Wednesday, April 3, 2019 8:43 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: what is the ticket # you have the credit on with AF? 

Will look for it 

> On Apr 3, 2019, at 3:31 PM, •: t. wrote: 

> I will need the ticket # you have the credit on with AF...did the ag=nt give to you when you cancelled? 
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