
From: Ann Rodriquez 
Sent: Monday, May 6, 2019 6:53 PM 
To: Snodgrass, Holly 
Cc: Benderman, Rhonda; Karyna Shuliak 
Subject: Re: rma109897 

will do. Thank you Holly 

Ann R. 

On May 6, 2019, at 2:02 PM, Snodgrass, Holly wrote: 

Hi Ann, <=span> 

I have attached a sh=pping label for your convenience. 

Please reference RMA=109897 when sending your unit(s) to: 

CARDIO PARTNERS=/o:p> 

1001 Flagpole Ct 

Brentwood TN 37027 

A PM/Calibration is $=9. If the AED is unable to pass inspection due to internal issue ther= is an inspection fee of 
$75 to cover labor. Please make sure that the RMA n=mber is clearly marked on the outside of the box. 

Your account is set u= on credit card terms. If you could tell me a good time to call and get tha= number on file I 
would appreciate it. Or if you would like to submit a cre=it application I am happy to forward one of those to you. If you 
have any questions please don't h=sitate to call or email. 

Have a great rest of=your day. 

Thank you, 

EFTA_R1_01213311 
EFTA02316156



Holly Snodgrass=/o:p> 

Cardio Partners I Biomedical Support 

1001 Flagpole Court, Brentwood TN 3702= 

Fax 

/span> <mailto 

www.cardiopartners.com <http://www.cardiopartners.co=/> </=> I www.aed.com=/span> 
chttp://www.aed.com/> 

<Fedex Ann.=ng> 
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