
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Friday, September 21, 2012 6:05 PM 

Re: Any news on payment? 

I have been hounding my client for payment. They do not seem in a hurry to submit since it took a year to receive the 
panels and you had their money for deposit that whole time. If I don't receive it from them soon, I will pay out of my 
own pocket. Either way, you will be paid. I'm asking for a little more time, as you asked continually from me. 
Thank you for your patience. 

On Sep 11, 2012, at 3:41 PM > wrote: 

Dear -
What news do you have regarding the outstanding on the bark panels. Would appreciate an update. 
Thanks 
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