
From: 
Sent: Monday, October 29, 2012 1:17 PM 
To: Steve Donnelly 
Subject: Re: Need to close 

Hi Steve, 
No problem on closing this out. Still haven't figured out what photo they wi=h to use for this. 
I think that credit card you have on file is cancelled. My new Amex is: 

Thanks! 

On Oct 25, 2012, at 11:51 AM, Steve Donnelly < 

> Hi 

> Hope all is well. I assume we are not going to be moving forward with 
> the=below original order & my accounting people are asking that we 
> close any op=n orders that are not proceeding. Please let me know if 
> it is OK to chargerthe credit card I have on file ending in 42016 & I 
> will be charging 

> Proofs - 2 rounds at $125.00 per round = $250.00 Color Correction = 
> $180.00 Delivery - 2 @ $23.-00 = $46.00 Tax = $42.25 Total = $518.25 

> Please let me know 
> Thank You 
> Steve 

> Steve Donnelly I Senior Account Executive 
> 132 West 31st Street 
> New York, NY 10001 
> Direct: 
> Mobile: 

> https://www.facebook.com/coloredge http://www.twitter.com/#!/coloredgeN=CLA http://www.coloredge.com/ 
> • Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

>  Original Message 
> From: K [mailto 
> Sent: Thursday, May 31, 2012 10:13 AM 
> To: Steve Donnelly 
> Subject: Re: 

> Hi steve, we are working on using a different photo, but don't have one ch=sen as of now. I guess it would be best to 
close out this order, then readd=ess once I know what photo they wish to use. 
> Thanks, 

> w=ote: 

EFTA_R1_01216598 
EFTA02316645



> On May 31, 2012, at 9:13 AM, Steve Donnelly wrote: 

» Hi 

» Hope all is well. We haven't heard back on the proof we sent out=to you. Please let me know if this will be moving 
forward or if this is al= we will be doing & I can close out the order. 

» Thank You 
» Steve 
>> 

>> 

» Steve Donnelly I Senior Account Executive 
» 127 West 30TH Street 
» New York, NY 10001 
» Direct: 
» Mobile: 

» https://www.facebook.com/coloredge http://www.twitter.comM i/coloredgeNYC=A 
» • Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
>> 

» Original Message 
» From: K (mailto 
» Sent: Friday, April 06, 2012 3:28 PM 
» To: Steve Donnelly 
» Subject: 

http://www.coloredge.com/ 

» Hi Steve, I am having messengered to you today the print I made on my Eps=n for you to try and match the coloring 
to on the new proof as well as one o= the proofs on the material I prefer. 
» Just as a note, I don't think the large size proof was the correct size o= the photo dimensions..it seemed alot smaller 
than 64" high. Perhaps the to=al material was 64".. I forgot to measure and I'm not near it now, but coul= you just 
confirm the actual photo needs to be 64" x160", then will need ad=ition blank material around the photo in order to 
eventually have it stretc=ed, etc.. 
» Thank you! 
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