
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Friday, November 9, 2012 9:26 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: Fwd: 

yes =ur credit is approximately $26,638 
we should =peak with kim or marc on warranty / refund on previous =ug how long did jee have before it =aded? 

please tell me time frame for ian so i =an look up cost for =ou 

thanks 

Richard Kahn 
He wants a new one for that room =ow, but different color/type. Do we still have a credit from =acco? 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein =It:jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Date: November 5, 2012 6:14:58 PM EST 

To: Sarah K >, 

we also should get a new rug for flagpole . send =his one to sacco. . it is not like we =rdered. 

=b 
The =nformation contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute =nside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the =ddressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized =se, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be =nlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please =otify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

=/blockquote> 
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