
From: Lena Romanowski 
Sent: Frida , December 14, 2012 7:09 PM 
To: 
Subject: RE: Gym Estimate 

Straight to the showroom. Please make sure it is sidemarked with your =ame. 

From:=/b 
Sent: Friday, =ecem er , : 
To: Paulette Gardener 
Cc: =ena Romanowski 
Subject: Re: Gym =stimate 

Thanks Paulette. I'm going to order the =eather today. Should I have it sent straight to your showroom, or =hat's the 
best address? 

On Dec 12, 2012, at 3:56 PM, =aulette Gardene ; wrote: 

See reply below from Lena 

Paulette 

From:=/b> =ena Romanowski 
To: =Paulette Gardener' 
Subject: RE: Gym =stimate 

=br>Sent: Wednesday, December 12, 2012 3:40 PM 

You will need an extra /2 hide and there will be an additional =harge of 400.00 

From :=/b> =aulette Gardener 
Sent: Wednesday, December , : = 
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To 
Subject:<=b> FW: Gym Estimate 
Importance: =igh 

Lena 

Email from for you, see below 

From:=/b> =br>Sent: Wednesday, December 12, 2012 12:45 PM 
To: =aulette Gar ener 
Subject: Re: Gym =stimate 
Importance: High 

Hello =aulette. Thank you, I received the quote. I believe Laina left this =xercise bike out of the quote because 
she said they wouldn't be about =o make the contours of the back fit how the the chair is shown. He =ould still like to 
have the bike recovered in leather and is OK if the =ack is not perfect and if there is some gaping. That being said, I'm 
=ondering if there is still enough leather to do all the machines with S =ides. I want to put in the order today and want to 
make sure to order =nough leather. can you please check on this for me? Many =hanks, 

On =ec 10, 2012, at 1:03 PM, Paulette Gardener • wrote: 

<image001.jpg> 

From:=/b> Paulette =ardener [mailt http://intbyroyale.com> 
Sent: Thursday, December 06, 2012 =: 
To: 
Subject: Gym =stimate 

Please see =ttached 
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Paulette =ardener - Bookkeeper 

Interiors =y Royale 

964 3rd =venue 

NYC =0155 

Tel No 

http://www.interiorsbyroyale.com/ 

<12-5-=012.xls> 
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