Sent: nursday, January 17, E

To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: sacco

Yes, we are paying for replacement, bu= | feel we should get back what we paid for the faded rug

On l=n 17, 2013, at 2:51 PM, Richard Kah_ -::mailtu_:: wrote:

thanks for feedback
did kim state whether or not we were=to pay for replacement?

HBRE Associate= Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th=Floor,
New York, New York 10022

re! I

cel

<f/=pan>
OnJan 17, 2013, at 12:27 PM,_ wrote:

We haven't sent it back yet. | think we are waiting on the replacemen= to come, but no, no reply either
way

12:2= PM, Richard Kahnii
<mailt = wrote:

has=kim replied to you at all on rug we sent back?

Richard Kahn

HBRE Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, N=w York 10022
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