From:

Sent: Tuesday, December 4, 2012 2:54 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Cc: Kim Steube: Rich Barnett

Subject: Re: Dining Room Proforma Invoice

which =ay is this taking place? Thursday or Friday?

On Nov =0, 2012, at 4:34 PM, Richard I{ahn_rote:

Jeffrey has approved install for Thursday or Friday =f next week
Please let us know which day
Thank =ou

fa
ce

On Mov 30, 2012, at 3:58 PM, Kim Steube wrote:

Hi =ich,
| was unable to move things =round on Tuesday. Can we install on Thurs or =riday?

KIM STEUBE

520 BROADWAY

6TH FLOOR

NEW YOREK, NY 10012

"I

From: Richard Kahn =mailto| GG <!t //gmail.com> |
Sent: Friday, November 30, 2012 =:18 PM
To: Kim =teube

Cr::_hch =arnett

Subject: Re: Dining Room Proforma =nvoice
Thanks

Hil
My installer is currently =ooked on Monday-Wednesday. |'m still trying to move things =round for
Tuesday but | won't be able to confirm until =omorrow.
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From

Sent: Thursday, November 29, 2012 =:41 AM
To: Richard =ahn

Cc: Kim =teube; Rich Barnett

Subject: Re: Dining Room Proforma =nvoice

Actually =an we switch to the &6th instead?

Kim Steube
sent: Monday, November 26, 2012 =0:53 AM
To: 'Richard =ahn'

c- I

Subject: RE: Dining Room Proforma =nvoice

KIM =TEUBE
520 =ROADWAY
6TH =LO0OR

M =
T:
<image005.gif=

From:

i will send money on =onday

please let us know what =ates next week work for installation
is this a 1 day =nstall?

Richard Kahn

HBREK =ssociates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York =0022

tel

fa

ce

On Nov 21, 2012, at 12:24 PM, Kim Steube =rote:

Have a =reat Thanksgiving!

KIM STEUBE

520 BROADWAY

BTH FLOOR

NEW YORK, NY 10012

g
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