
From: Ryan Giunta < 
Sent: Thursda Jamie 24, 2013 4:43 AM 
To: 
Cc: Melissa Kamlet 
Subject: Re: The Closet lady: Confirmation of Consultation 1/24/13 

Thanks for the intrc 
=br> 
Melissa - nice to meet you by email. I will plan to arrive by=9:50am to meet you a f you are able to bring 
the laminated h=le covers with the adhesive backing tomorrow, could you bring 6-10 to have o= hand? 

If you do not have them handy to bring, cou=d we order 10 of them from you? 

All the best. 

<=iv>Ryan 

On Jan 23, 2013, at 11:33 PM &=t <mailto -> wrote: 

Hi Melissa, 
Ryan will be m=st likely meeting with you tomorrow instead of me. His number Regarding the 

$125 fee, will that be deducted from the cost of any proje=t we go forward with? Also, would you be able to bring with 
you some of the=sticky hole covers for the existing closets here as shown in the photo belo=? 

Man thanks, 

On Jan 23, 2013, at 3:33 PM, Melissa Kamlet < 

H 

<mailto >  wrote: 

I will meet you tomorrow morning (addr=ss below) Thursday the 24th at 10:00am for your consult. Our 
fee is due on s=te as discussed for $125 in cash or check made out to Melissa Kamlet. Looki=g forward to working with 
you and making all changes and additions needed. S=ould you wish to reach me sooner my contact information is listed 
below. Pl=ase confirm this email....Enjoy a nice day. 
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