
From: 
Sent: Monday, December 10, 2012 6:23 PM 
To: Kim Steube 
Subject: Re: Dining Room Proforma Invoice 

Carpet looks great!! =hanks! 

On Dec 7, 2012, at 10:29 AM, Kim Steube 

KIM =TEUBE 

ote: 

<image002.gif> <x-msg://597/facebook.com/saccocarpet> <image003.gif><image004.jpg>cimage006.gif> 

From: Richard Kahn = 
Sent: Tuesday, Decemi..... = 
To: Kim =teube 
Cc: Rich =arnett 
Subject: Re: Dining Room Proforma =nvoice 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates =nc. 

The cost will be $650. Let me =now 

KIM =TEUBE 
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From: 

Installation will be on =hursday. 
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From:Kim 
Thank you 

On Dec 4, 2012, at 9:54 AM, =rote: 

On =ov 30, 2012, at 4:34 PM, Richard Kahn < 

Jeffrey has approved install for Thursday or Friday of next =eek 
Please let us =now which day 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 

On Nov 30, 2012, at 3:58 PM, Kim Steube =rote: 

KIM STEUBE 

From: 

Hi MI, 
My installer is currently booked on =onday-Wednesday. I'm still trying to move things around for =uesday but I 

won't be able to confirm until =omorrow. 

KIM STEUBE 

From imailto 
Sent: Thursday, November 29, 2012 =:41 AM 
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To: Richard =ahn 
Cc: Kim =teube; Rich Barnett 
Subject: Re: Dining Room Proforma =nvoice 

Please let me know if early next week works for the =nstall as we will need to organize movers to remove the 
furniture from =he room, unless the installers can move the furniture? 

On =ov 28, 2012, at 4:O6 PM, Richard Kahn <Jeffrey prefers Monday or Tuesday for installation as he may be in 
=own on Dec 6th 

thank you 

On Nov 26, 2012, at 10:55 AM, Kim Steube =rote: 

KIM STEUBE 

From 
Subject: RE: Dining Room Proforma =nvoice 

I =ope you had a great Holiday! 
The install will take 1 day. Can we =chedule for next Tuesday 4th ? My head mechanic is =ut this week and I 

prefer that I use my best crew on your =obs. 
Let me know if the 4th works for =ou. 

Thanks! 

KIM STEUBE 

Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Dining Room Proforma =nvoice 

i =ill send money on monday 
please let us know what dates next week work for =nstallation 
is =his a 1 day install? 

happy thanksgiving 

Richard Kahn 
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HBRK Associates =nc. 

Hi =ich, 
The Dining room carpet just arrived. Please see invoice attached =or payment. 
Have a great Thanksgiving! 
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