
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Richard Bamett 
Tuesday, December 4, 2012 9:48 PM 

FW: outstanding invoice payment 

From 
To 
Subject: FW: ou=standing invoice payment 
Date: Tue, 4 Dec 2012 11:46:29 -0500 

See below 

Jeff Sternhell 

Vice President 

Cuttin: Ed:e S stems 

From: Richard Kahn (mailto 
Sent: Tuesday, December 04, 2012 9:54 AM To:<=B> Jeff Sternhell 
Subject: Re: outstanding invoice payment 

sending wire this am 

please confirm receipt and let me know when you wil= be at 9 east for install 

thanks 

EFTA_R1_01225408 
EFTA02318636



Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

</=IV> 

New York, New York 10022</=PAN> 

On Dec 3, 2012, at 12:06 PM, Jeff Sternhell w=ote: 

Richard: 

Regarding our conversation this morning we cannot mov= forward on any new work that was agreed upon as per my 
meeting with the p=incipal last week until we are paid in full for work completed back in Sep=ember for the media 
room, that being repair and labor of the shades. l=92ve attached the invoice once again and after receiving the $4838.61 
from=you we are still owed $2449.68, please pay this outstanding amount so th= next 2 agreed upon phases (see below) 
can be completed before the princip=l returns. 

• Install new receiver and n=w remote in media room and configure to the system 

• Upgrade the gym system, =olding off on a new TV until newer models come out in early 2013 

Best 

Jeff 

Jeff Sternhell 

Vice President 

Cutting Edge Systems 
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