
From: Richard Kah 
Sent: Wednesday, November 21, 2012 9:34 PM 
To: Kim Steube 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: Dining Room Proforma Invoice 

i will send money on monday 
please let us know =hat dates next week work for installation is this a 1 day =nstall? 

thank you 
happy =hanksgiving 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Nov 21, 2012, at 12:24 PM, Kim Steube wrote: 

Hi Rich, 
The Dining room carpet just arrived. Please see =nvoice attached for payment. 
I will coordinate =n installation date with lext week. 

Have a great =hanksgiving! 

KIM STEUBE 
520 =ROADWAY 
<image002.gif><image003.gif><image004.jpg><image006.gif> 

<SOSORD1.doc> 

EFTA_R1_01225715 
EFTA02318781


