
From: 
Sent: Friday, November 19, 2010 10:16 PM 
To: Story Cowles 
Subject: Re: 

I know! 
On Nov 19, 2010, at 5:03 PM, Story Cowles wrote: 

> We need to take care of that! We need to pay Comcast and be =eimbursed. Don't want this to do anything to your 
credit. 

> Sent from Story's iPhone 

> On Nov 19, 2010, at 5:01 PM rote: 

» btw.. 
» got a call from a recovery company on behalf of comcast to see how =hey can recover the 3 cable boxes from 
everglade.. 
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