
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Friday, Decem er , : 
To: bellaklein 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: Ion Nicola invoice for 111 

thank =ou 
please have anothny let us know when it will be paid so we can =nform ion as i am sure he wants money =sap thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Dec 21, 2012, at 2:07 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

Thank you 

On Dec 21, 2012, at 2:05 PM, =rote: 

Anthony Barrett is responsible =or this. I will forward it to him. Thanks 

On Dec 21, 2012, =t 1:58 PM, bellaklein c > =rote: 

Hi and 
Attached please find Ion bill for apt 111. Please approve =or payment. 
Thank you and Happy =olidays! 
Bella 

Begin forwarded =essage: 

From 

Date: December 21, 2012 1:22:07 PM EST 

To: 

Subject: Message from =MBT_C253 
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Reply-To: 

CKMBT_C25312122114220.pdf> 

c=blockquote> 
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