
From: Colette Mc Goldrick < 
Sent: Frida , December 14, 2012 2:59 PM 
To: 
Subject: 3m 
Attachments: 3M BILL.doc 

Hi M, 

Attached is the bill for apt 3M. If you could send me a check id really appreciate it. 

Thanks 

Colette 

 Original Message 
From: 
Sent: Sunday, December 02, 2012 7:39 PM 
To: Flooring Liquidators > 
Subject: Please disregard previous email!! 

Hi Colette.. 
Andrew, the super at 301 E 66th st said they can get into 3M without the key, so we are still good to go with starting the 
floors tomorrow, Monday morning in 3M. Thank you!! 
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