From: I

Sent: Wednesday, March 16, 2011 6:15 PM

To: Emad Hanna

Cc: Gary Kerney; Richard Kahn (Gmail Contact); William Rowles
Subject: Re: LS) Construction

A refund of $1,989 has been put back on my Amex for =he return of these sinks..
(There was a restocking fee for =eturning them)

On Mar 16, 2011, at 11:50 AM, =mad Hanna wrote:

Gary,
| was informed back in December the attached purchased by -.vaa for the below job
LS) # 1004 cost code 15-401

Mow I'm just hearing these sinks were not used for this =roject so what | would like to know is where are these
sinks and why do =e have a breakdown in communication. This was posted to the job and if =t was not used than we
need to reclass this =xpense.

Thank =ou
Fax (646) 350-0221
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