
From: 
Sent: Wednesday, March 16, 2011 6:18 PM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: LS1 Construction 

Thanks. do you know if the mattress also =rrived? 

On Mar 16, 2011, at 2:17 PM, Emad Hanna =rote: 

Thank =ou 

A refund of $1,989 has been put =ack on my Amex for the return of these =inks.. 
(There was a restocking =ee for returning them) 

On Mar 16, 2011, at 11:50 =M, Emad Hanna wrote: 
Gary, 

# =004 cost code 15-401 

Emad =anna 
Project Controller 
Suite =OF 
New York, NY 10065 
St. Thomas =ffice 340 775-2525 
NY Office 
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