
From: 
Sent: Wednesday, March 16, 2011 6:26 PM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: LS1 Construction 

yes, that sounds right.. 

On Mar =6, 2011, at 2:20 PM, Emad Hanna wrote: 

So do =ou think it might be the mattress and a box =pring? 

Emad =anna 
Project =ontroller 
HBRK =ssociates 
301 East 66th =t 
Suite =OF 
New = 
Cell 
LSJ Office 
St. Thom = • 
NY Office 
Fax 

From 
Sent: Wednesday, March 16, 2011 =:18 PM 
To: Emad =anna 
Subject: Re: LSJ =onstruction 

On Mar 16, 2011, at 2:17 =M, Emad Hanna wrote: 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 
Project =ontroller 
HBRK Associates 
301 East 66th =t 
Suite =OF 
Ne 
Cell 
LS1 Office (340) 77 -
St. Thom 
NY Office 
Fax
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Sent: Wednesday, March 16, 2011 =:15 PM 
To: Emad =anna 
Cc: Gary=Kerney; Richard Kahn (Gmail Contact); William =owles 
Subject: Re: LSJ =onstruction 

A refund of =1,989 has been put back on my Amex for the return of these =inks.. 
(There was a restocking =ee for returning them) 

On Mar 16, 2011, at 11:50 AM, Emad Hanna =rote: 
Gary, 

1Si # 1004 cost code =5-401 

Thank =ou 

Emad =anna 
Project =ontroller 
HBRK =ssociates 
301 East 66th =t 
Suite 10F 
New York NY =0065 
Cell 
LS.I Office 
St. Thomas Offic 
NY 
Fax 

<=diy> 
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