
From: 
Sent: ues ay, ay , : 
To: emad hanna 
Subject: Re: Fed Ex 

that's the fedex account I've always used from the office. 
It's =he only one I'm aware of us ever having and the only one I've ever used =or the past 10 years.. 
does that =elp? 

On May 31, 2011, at 12:10 emad hanna wrote: 

Hi I., 

We =eceived a FedEx bill for $470.19 for Fabric for the Banquet on LSJ and =he FedEx account # is 1144-2081-6 

Gary told me =hat you sent this to LSJ. Can you tell me who's account that =s? 

Thank =ou 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 
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