
From: 
Sent: Wednesday, June 15, 2011 1:48 PM 
To: emad hanna 
Subject: Re: shipment from the Flea market 

Great!! thanks! 

On Jun 15, 2011, at 9:41 AM, emad =anna wrote: 

As promised updated =nformation on the Chandelier 

See =elow 

Thank =ou 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 

Departure from Antwerp : =6/24/11 

Arrival at St Thomas : =7/22/11 

Estimate dimensions crate : 220x130x60 =m / 150 kg 

Here is the company contact in St =homas : 

Address 

Phone 

Fax 

Email 

ocean@boblynchmovers.com 

U.S. Virgin =slands 

I remain at your =isposal, 

Christophe Auge 
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"alt;logo signature.jpg> 

138-140 rue des =osiers 
Marche dauphine stand 26 

=/span> 
le 14 juin 2011 a 17:59, emad hanna a ecrit = 

Christophe, 

Would be possible for you to call me at =y NY office number listed below 

Thank =ou 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 
301 East 66th St 
Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 

On Jun 14, 2011, at 2:59 AM, =hristophe Auge wrote: 

Hello, 

Yes, =e have picked-up your chandelier and it should be packed since the end =f this week. 

Can you send me the contact of =our freight forwarder in St Thomas who will do import custom 
clearance =amp; delivery for you in order to coordinate your shipment = 

Brgds, 

Christophe Auge 

=R;logo signature.jpg> 

138-140 rue des =osiers 
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Marche dauphine stand 26 
93400 St =uen 
tel/fax : +33 1 40129804 
mob : +33 6 =0790629 
christophe@shipantiques.fr<=div> 

Le 13 juin 2011 a =6:40, emad hanna a kilt : 

Christophe, 

Can you tell me if the chandelier has =een picked up? 

Thank =ou 

Emad Hanna 

I remain at your =isposal. 

Christophe Auge 

Ship =ntiques 
+33620790629 

Le 2 juin 2011 a 18:12, emad =anna <emad.hanna01@gmail.com> a =E9crit : 

Christophe, 

Please arrange for the =ick up and packaging of this Chandelier as soon as =ossible. 

Can you provide me with an invoice =or this shipment to St. Thomas and your bank 
wiring information so that =ie can wire the funds so we can get this process =oving? 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 
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=/blockquote> 

<=cliv> 
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