
From: 
Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2011 8:48 PM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Fwd: Epstein proforma invoice 

please see below. Should I also have her price out shipping to the New =ersey Tropical location? May I have that address 
to forward to her for =ricing? thanks.. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Kim Steube 
=/div> 
Date: July 27, 2011 r:45:59 PM EDT 

To: 

> 

=div style="margin-top: Opx; margin-right: Opx; margin-bottom: 0px; =argin-left: 0px;">Subject: RE: Epstein 
=roforma invoice 

Hi 
This proforma =nvoice does not include the freight to FL. I'm still 
working =n it. I should have that for you by Friday. 

You can pay =alance by check or credit card. But we prefer =heck:) 

KIM STEUBE 
520 BROADWAY 
6TH =LOOR 
NEW YORK. NY 10012 

www.saccocarpet.com 

From: 
To: Kim Steube 
Subject: =e: Epstein proforma invoice 

=br>Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2011 2:07 PM 

Thank you Kim! That's great news. =br>Does this invoice include the shipping costs from New York to =ropical 
Shipping in Florida? 

EFTA_R1_01236751 
EFTA02323152



What is the best way to pay the =nvoice; credit card, wire transfer, 
check? Do you have a =reference? 
Thou! 

On Jul 27, 2011, at 12:24 PM, =im Steube wrote: 

«Scan_Doc0137.pdf» =br> 

Hi 

I hope you are well and =njoying the summer. 

Good news! =nbsp;All of Jeffery's rugs are in. We will be blocking =he 

Master Bedroom rug =omorrow and preparing all the rugs for =hipping. 

They will be ready =o go by early next week. 

Please see =ttached Proforma Invoice for payment due before =hipping. 

Let me know if =ou have any questions. 

Thanks, 

KIM =TEUBE 

520 =ROADWAY 

6TH =LOOR 

NEW YORK, NY =0012 
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