
From: 
Sent: Thursday, June 16, 2011 1:59 PM 
To: Steve Donnelly 
Subject: Re: photo on vinyl 

Great! That is actually an old card. I can give you my new card number =ver the phone if you'd like to call me when you 
are ready for it? 

And yes, 9 E. 71st is the correct delivery address. 

On Jun 16, 2011, at 9:52 AM, Steve Donnelly wrote: 

> Good Morning= 

> We have the banner ready to ship today. Please let me know if we 
> =hould deliver to 9 E. 71st St. Also, the credit card I have on file =nds in _& exp on Is this the card I should 
charge? 

> Please let me know 
> Thank You 
> Steve 

> Ori:inal Messa:e 
> From: 
> Sent: Tuesday, June 14, 2011 4:17 PM 
> To: Steve Donnelly 
> Subject: Re: photo on vinyl 

> Great thank you! No rush.. 

> On Jun 14, 2011, at 4:14 PM, Steve Donnelly > wrote: 

» Thanks 

» I'll make sure that the concerns you have for the file are addressed = will go to final. Do you have a due date for this, 
or can we deliver =n 2 - 3 days? 

» Please let me know 
» Thanks 
» Steve 

» 
O. . 

» From 
» Sent: Monday, June 13, 2011 7:01 PM 
» To: Steve Donnelly 
» Subject: photo on vinyl 

» Hi Steve, 

EFTA_R1_01237813 

EFTA02323392



» Sorry this took so long, but the last panoramic photo of the ocean I =ent to you was approved for printing! The only 
thing is, the large size =lice of the photo you had printed, the photo was only 54" tall in the =ample, when the actual 
photo needs to be printed 57" x 530" and there =eeds to be about a 4" border of blank canvas around the photo to help 
=ith the mounting process. So overall the complete piece of material =ould be 65" x 538". 
» ou! 
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