
From: 
Sent: Tuesday, June 21, 2011 3:54 PM 
To: Sean Lachance 
Cc: Diane Breslow 
Subject: Re: Global TRADITIONAL JUDGE'S Chair 

Any idea on how many yards of fabric are required =or this chair? 
Thanks. 

On =un 20, 2011, at 11:25 AM, Sean Lachance wrote: 

See =he note from Diane below 

Sean =aChance 

From: Diane Breslow =mailto 
Sent: Monday, June 20, 2011 11:22 =M 
To: Sean =achance 
Subject: RE: Global TRADITIONAL =UDGE'S Chair 

What =abric company is she using....maybe it's a grade in =anufacturer...worth checking before jumping through 
all the =oops! 

Las Olas City Centre 
401 East Las Olas Blvd-Suite 230 
Ft Lauderdale, Florida =3301 

www.globaltotaloffice.com 
EVOLVE FURNITURE =ROUP =nbsp; &n=sp; GLOBALcare &n=sp; &nbs=; =nbsp; 

&n=sp; www.officestogousa.com 

From: Sean Lachance =mailto 
Sen day, June 20, 2011 11:19 =M 
To: 
Cc: Diane =reslow 
Subject: RE: Global =hair 
Diane 

<image001.jpg> 
2099 W. Atlantic =lvd 
Pom ano =each FL 33069 
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Hi =ean, 
Can you please let me =now how many yards of fabric is required for this chair? I'm sourcing =nother fabric, but 

don't know how much we need. =hanks.. 

On Jun 15, 2011, at 11:01 =M, Sean Lachance wrote: 

I =ave your authorization form, 
We receive acknowledgement from =lobal, that the fabric is on back order and they won't have the chair =ntil 

September. 

Let me know =hanks 
<image001.jpg> 
2099 W. Atlantic =lvd 
slachance@ofwfl.com 
From:Sarah 

<image001.jpg> 
2099 W. Atlantic =lvd 
Pompano Beach, FL =3069 
P: =54-968-4700 
F: =nbsp;954-968-4897 

From: 
Sent: Friday, June 10, 2011 1:46 =M 
To: Sean =achance 
Subject: Re: Global =hair 

OK, thank you. Can you please send an invoice and I will send =ou the credit card info after? =hanks.. 

On Jun 10, 2011, at 12:57 PM, Sean Lachance =rote: 

Also let me know when we can =xpect =ayment. 
I've attached a credit card =uthorization =orm. 
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Sent: Friday, June 10, 2011 10:16 =M 
To: Sean =achance 
Subject: Re: Global =hair 
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=div style="margin-top: Oin; margin-right: Oin; margin-bottom: =.0001pt; margin-left: Oin; font-size: 12pt; font-
family: 'Times New =oman', serif; => 

Here is my Certificate of Authority. I would like to pay the =axed though please, so please include them in your 
invoice. Thank =ou.. 

<=div> 

3 

EFTA_R1_01237914 
EFTA02323405


