From:

Sent: Thursday, June 16, 2011 2:25 PM
To: Sean Lachance
Subject: Re: Global Chair

| spoke to my client, and | will be looking for a =ifferent fabric. | will be in touch. thank you..

On =un 15, 2011, at 11:01 AM, Sean Lachance wrote:

| =ave your authorization form,
We receive acknowledgement from =lobal, that the fabric is on back order and they won't have the chair =ntil
September.

Let =e know Thanks
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2099 W, Atlantic =lvd

| just faxed you the credit =ard authorization form. can you pls confirm you received it? Also, if =ou can please
let me know the lead time on this and approximately when =t might ship out?
Thank =ou..

On Jun 10, 2011, at 4:56 =M, Sean Lachance wrote:

Sean =aChance
Pompano Beach, FL 33069

Sent: Friday, June 10, 2011 1:46 =M
To: Sean =achance
Subject: Re: Global =hair

OK, thank you. =an you please send an invoice and | will send you the credit card info =fter? Thanks..

Also let me know when we can =xpect payment.
I've attached a credit card =uthorization form.
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From: [
Sent: Friday, June 10, 2011 10:16 =M

To: Sean =achance

Subject: Re: Global =hair

Here is my Certificate of Authority. | would like to pay the =axed though please, so please include them in your

invoice. Thank =ou..
<PEACHW - OFW Invoice.pdf =5674.pdf>
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